CITY OF FAIRHOPE

BID TABULATION

BID NO: 021-10

BIiD NAME: JANITORIAL SERVICES

BID OPENED: January 19, 2011 2:00 P.M.

Note: Bid Bond 5§ %. (Not required if less than $10,000)

VENDOR

Bid Proposal
BID PRICE PER  Executed / Signed /
MONTH Notarized

Notarized

Non-Collusion
Statement

SIGNED

Signed / ADDENDUM 1

&2

Bid Bond

SERVICE MASTER ACTION CLEANING

*City Services/ Public Utilities {5 days wk)

$2,122.00 [YES

YES

YES

YES

555 S Section Strest

__‘Fairhope City Hall ( 5 days wk)

$1.633.00

161 N Sections Strest

*Fairhope Museum of History (5 days wk)

$1,838.00

__24 N Section Strest

__“Fairhope Welcome Center (5 days wk)

$597.00

20 N. Section Streat

_"Quail Creek Golf Pro Shop/Clubhouse ( 7 days wk)

1.922.00

19841 Quail Creek Drive

“James P.Nix Senior Center ( 5 days wk)

$3,733.00

1 Bayou Drive

Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk)

no bid

803 Greeno Road

|OFFICE PRIDE COMMERCIAL CLEANING

“City Services/ Public Utilities (5 days wk)

555 8 Section Street

*Fairhope City Hall { 5 days wk)

161 N Sections Strest

“Fairhope Museum of History (5 days wk)

24 N Section Street

*Fairhope Welcome Center (5 days wk)

20 N. Section Street

*Quail Creek Golf Pro Shop/Clubhouse ( 7 days wk)

¥ n| e

19841 Quail Creek Drive

*James P.Nix Senior Center ( § days wk)

1 Bayou Drive

“Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk)

803 Greeno Road

SUNCOAST

No response no response

no response

no response

no response

*City Services/ Public Utilities (5 days wk)

555 § Section Street

*Fairhope City Hall { 5 days wk)

161 N Sections Street

*Fairhope Museum of History (5 days wk)

24 N Section Street

*Fairhope Welcome Center (5 days wk)

| __20N. Section Street

| "Quail Creek Golf Pro Shop/Clubhouse { 7 days wk)

19841 Quail Creek Drive

*James P.Nix Senior Center { 5 days wk)

1 Bayou Drive

. ‘Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk)

803 Greeno Road




Non-CoHusion

Bid Proposal Statement SIGNED
BID PRICE PER  |Executed / Signed / Signed / ADDENDUM 1

VENDOR MONTH Notarized Notarized &2 Bid Bond

|JAN! KING OF MOBILE/PENSACOLA o o
“City Services/ Public Utilities (5 days wk) | $1,294.38 YES YES YES YES

| 5558 Section Street o ]
“Fairhope City Hall { 5 days wk) - $1,754.40 B
181 N Sections Street ; . o ]
“Fairhope Museum of History (5 days wk) - $500.82 o — .

24 N Section Strast B V ]

| *Fairhope Welcome Center (5 days wk) $362.69 -

| 20N, Section Street _ . ]
*Quail Creek Golf Pro ShopiClubhouse ( 7 days wk) $1,044.24 3 e e
19841 Quail Creek Drive . _ _ e
"James P.Nix Senior Center ( 5 days wk) $1,214.78 . - ~

| 1 Bayou Drive o i R
“Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk) $2,643.06 e e o
803 Greeno Road

PORT CITY JANITORIAL SERVICES No Bid [No Bid !No Bid | NoBid No Bid

| __"City Services/ Public Utilities (5 days wk)

855 S Section Strest

*Fairhope City Hall ( 5 days wk)

| 161N Sections Strest

| ___“Fairhope Museum of History (5 days wk)

24 N Section Street

*Fairhope Welcome Center (5 days wk)

20 N. Section Street

*Quail Creek Golf Pro Shop/Clubhouse { 7 days wk)

19841 Quail Creek Drive

*James P.Nix Senior Center ( 5 days wk)

1 Bayou Drive

*Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk)

803 Greeno Road

E & F DEPENDABLE JANITORIAL SERVICE

no response

no response

no response

no response

no response

*City Services/ Public Utilities (5 days wk)

555 S Section Street

*Fairhope City Hall ( 5 days wk)

161 N Sections Strest

“Fairhope Museum of History (5 days wk)

| 24 N Section Street

“Fairhope Welcome Center (5 days wk}

20 N. Section Street

*Quail Creek Golf Pro Shop/CIuBhouse { 7 days wk)

19841 Quail Creek Drive

“James P.Nix Senior Center ( § days wk)

1 Bayou Drive

*Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk)

® AL sl e |ea] e e

803 Greeno Road

COMPLETE JANITORIAL

no response

Nno response

__Inoresponse

no response

no response

“City Services/ Public Utllities (5 5 days wk)

555 S Section Street

*Fairhope City Hall { 5 days wk)

| 161 N Sections Street

__24 N Section Strest

“Fairhope Welcome Center (§ days wk)

20 N. Section Strest

*Quail Creek Golf Pro Shop/Clubhouse {

19841 Quail Creek Drive

"James P.Nix Senior Center ( Sﬁdays wk)

*Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk)

803 Greeno Road




RECOMMENDATION: REJECT 29405 [

VENDOR

BID PRICE PER

MONTH

Bid Proposal
Executed / Signed /
Notarized

Non-Collusion
Statement
Signed /
Notarized

SIGNED
ADDENDUM 1
&2

*City Services/ Public Utilities (5 days wk)

no response

no response

no response

no response

555 § Section Street

*Fairhope City Hall { 5 days wk)

$

181 N Sections Street

*Fairhope Museum o?ﬁs]ﬂ@ days wk)

24 N Section Street

“Fairhope Welcome Center (5 days wk)

20 N. Section Street

*Quail Creek Golf Pro Shop/Clubhouse { 7 days wk)

19841 Quail Creek Drive

_..James P.Nix Senior Center { 5 days wk)
1 Bayou Drive

“Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk)

803 Greeno Road

360CLEAN o
| “City Services/ Public Utilities (5 days wk) i $1,953.00 YES YES YES YES |
| 5558 Section Street
. ‘Fairhope City Hall { § days wk) $2,480.00
181 N Sections Strest
| :Fairhope Museum of History (5 days wk) o $660.00 ]
.24 N Section Street . ]
“Fairhope Welcome Center (5 days wk) $260.00
|20 N. Section Street
*Quail Creek Golif Pro Shop/Clubhouse ( 7 days wk) $1,411.00
19841 Quail Creek Drive
“James P.Nix Senior Center { 5 days wk) $1,550.00
1 Bayou Drive =
“Fairhope Recreation Center (7 days wk) $8,314.00

803 Gresno Road

S s/
ANANS Y
J?fm@‘ér Fia’ler,gpirég:or of Public Works
R e’

2 2
I

To the best of my knowledge this is an accurate Bid Tabulation

o Z

=)

Daniel P. Ames, Purchasing Manager

k=34




