CITY OF FAIRHOPE

BID TABULATION & RECOMMENDATION

BID NO: 008-11

BID NAME: LIFT STATION ODOR CONTROL CHEMICALS
BID OPENED: FEBRUARY 1, 2011

Note: Bid Bond REQUIRED

\BID BOND Bid Proposal | COST PER | DOLLARS PER SITE |
SUBMITTED | Executed/Signed/ | AddendumNo1& 2 |METERED GALLON ! PER YEAR ANNUAL TOTAL
VENDOR Notarized signed and returned |
SOLEN (CHEMTECH) No Response No Response No Response ['No Response INo Response No Response
Twin Beech #1 PS
Twin Beech #2 PS
Carya Point PS§
Woodlands PS

Quait Creek PS #1

East of the Sun PS

" White Grove PS

Thompson Hall PS

Grand Hotel P§

Baldwin 1 PS§
ANNUAL TOTAL
BIOMAGIC INCOMPLETE YES YES
Twin Beech #1 P§ $ 6.30  § 22,995.00
| Twin Beech #2PS $ 6.30 | § 18,396.00
Carya Point PS $ 6.30  § 6,323.63
Woodiands PS $ 630 % 27,594.00
Quail Creek PS #1 $ 6.30 § 27,594.00
East of the Sun PS $ 6.30 | § 16,096.50
White Grove PS $ 6.30 | $ 14,946.75
Thompson Hall PS $ 630 8% 22,985.00
Grand Hotel P§ $ 630 $ 17,246.25
Baldwin 1 P§ $ 6.30$ 11,497.50
ANNUAL TOTAL 185,684.63

FOG FREE TECHNOLOGIES No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

Twin Beech #1 PS

" Twin Beech #2 PS

Carya Point P§

Woodiands PS

Quail Creek PS #1

East of the Sun PS

White Grove PS

Thompson Hall PS

Grand Hotel PS

Baldwin 1 PS

ANNUAL TOTAL




BID BOND Bid Proposal COST PER DOLLARS PER SITE
SUBMITTED Executed / Signed/ | Addendum No1& 2 |METERED GALLON PER YEAR ANNUAL TOTAL
VENDOR Notarized signed and returned
SIEMENS WATER TECHNOLOGIES CORP yes yes yes
Twin Beech #1 PS $ 2721 % 26,309.20
Twin Beech #2 PS $ 272§ 26,309.20
Carya Point PS $ 272 % 6,949.60
Woodlands PS $ 272 $ 31,769.60
Quail Creek PS #1 $ 272 % 21,841.60
East of the Sun PS $ 27218 18,863.20
White Grove PS $ 272 $ 7,942.40
Thompson Hall P$ $ 2721% 24,820.00
| Grand Hotel PS $ 272 % 32,762.40
Baldwin 1 PS $ 272% 3,971.20
ANNUAL TOTAL .
$ 201,538.40
DPC ENTERPRISES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHEM STATION GULF COAST DID NOT ATTEND MANDATORY PRE-BID MEETING
F2 INDUSTRIES DID NOT ATTEND MANDATORY PRE-BID MEETING
INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS DID NOT ATTEND MANDATORY PRE-BID MEETING
PENNCO DID NOT ATTEND MANDATORY PRE-BID MEETING
NORIT AMERICAS, INC DID NOT ATTEND MANDATORY PRE{-BID MEETING
1
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Recommendation: REJECT ALL BIDS AND REBID
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To the best of my knowledge this is an accurate Bid Tabulation
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Sewer Dept Daniel P. Ames, Purchasing Manager

nt 2,300




