

CITY OF FAIRHOPE
 BID TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION
 BID NO. : 032-10
 BID NAME: WEATHERED STEEL POLES
 BID OPENED: 09-13-10
 Note: Bid Bond waived

VENDOR	Non-Collusion Statement Signed / Notarized	Bid Proposal Executed / Signed / Notarized	Delivery/lead time ARO	Manufacturer	Size 70/1 Bid Price Per Unit	Size 75/H1 Bid Price Per Unit	Size 70/1 Bid Price Per 18 Units	Size 75/H1 Bid Price Per 6 Units	Total Bid Price	Addendum 1 signed & returned
HD Supply Utilities					NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
Roxel Inc.					NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE		NO RESPONSE
Infratech Corporation					NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE		NO RESPONSE
Tri-State Utility Products, Inc.					NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE		NO RESPONSE
Osmose					NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE	NO RESPONSE		NO RESPONSE
Valmont Newark	YES	YES	12 WEEKS	Valmont Newark	\$2,612.00	\$3,144.00	\$47,016.00	\$18,864.00	\$65,880.00	NO
Bridgwell Resources	YES	YES	56 DAYS	Trinity Utility Structures	\$2,091.00	\$2,370.00	\$37,638.00	\$14,220.00	\$51,858.00	YES
Thomas & Betts	YES	YES	90 DAYS	Thomas & Betts	\$2,989.00	\$3,323.00	\$53,802.00	\$19,938.00	\$73,740.00	NO
Dis-Tran	YES	YES	84 DAYS	Dis-Tran Steel, LLC	\$3,202.00	\$3,489.00	\$57,636.00	\$20,934.00	\$78,570.00	NO

Recommendation: Award bid to Bridgwell Resources, LLC,
 for their bid totaling \$51,858.00

Scott Sligh 9/14/2010
 Scott Sligh, P.E., Electric Superintendent

To the best of my knowledge this is a true and accurate bid tabulation

Daniel P. Ames 9/14/2010
 Daniel P. Ames, Purchasing Manager